
NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
 
Adopted Ordinance # Title     
09/20/11 004-2011 2006 IFC Page 1 of 5 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND REPLACING IN ITS ENTIRETY 
ORDINANCE # 005-2006 OF THE NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT FOR 
THE ESTABLISHMENT OF MINIMUM REGULATIONS GOVERNING THE 
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE 2006 EDITION. 
  
WHEREAS, for the purpose of regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and 
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of 
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or 
property in the occupancy of buildings and premises in the district;  and 
 
WHEREAS, Section 321.220(12), for the purpose of providing fire protection to 
property in the District, the district and, on its behalf, the board shall have the following 
powers, authority and privilege: 
 
(12) To adopt and amend bylaws, fire protection and fire prevention ordinances, and any 
other rules and regulations not in conflict with the constitution and laws of this state, 
necessary for the carrying on of the business, objects and affairs of the board and of the 
district, and refer to the proper authorities for prosecution any infraction thereof 
detrimental to the district.  Any person violating any such ordinance is hereby declared to 
be guilty of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be punished as is provided 
by law therefore.  The enactments of the fire district in delegating administrative 
authority to officials of the district may provide standards of action for the administrative 
officials, which standards are declared as industrial codes adopted by nationally 
organized and recognized trade bodies.  
 
WHEREAS, The 2006 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the 
International Code Council (ICC) is the Fire Prevention Code of the Nixa Fire Protection 
District; for the control of buildings, structures as herein provided, and each and all of the 
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Code are hereby referred 
to, adopted and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this Ordinance. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS OF 
THE NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT, as follows: 
 
That Ordinance 005-2006 is repealed in its entirety and that the following is adopted as 
the new Fire Code of the Nixa Fire Protection District: 
 
CODE ADOPTION 
 
The 2006 edition of the International Fire Code as published by the International Code 
Council, IS THE Fire Prevention Code of the Nixa Fire Protection District and shall be 



NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
 
Adopted Ordinance # Title     
09/20/11 004-2011 2006 IFC Page 2 of 5 

executed by the City of Nixa Chief Building Inspector for the control of buildings and 
structures as herein provided, and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, 
conditions and terms of said ICC International Fire Code are hereby referred to; adopted 
and made part hereof as is fully set out in this Ordinance, with additions, insertions, 
deletions and changes, if any prescribed by this ordinance. 
 
AMENDMENTS 
 
The 2006 edition of the International Fire Code for the Nixa Fire Protection District is 
amended to include: 
 
I. Chapter 1, Administration: 
 

A. Section 101.1, Authority, of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be amended to 
read as follows; 
 
1. Insert the Nixa Fire Protection District 

 
II. Chapter 5, Fire Service Features: 
 

A. Section 503.1, Fire Lanes, of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be amended 
to read as follows; 

 
1. The fire chief may designate fire lanes on private, and or, public property.  

Such area shall be designated by signs at each end of the lane which say “No 
Parking Fire Lane” with appropriate curb markings. Curb markings shall be 
red painted back ground with white painted letters six (6) inches in size.  Fire 
lanes may be established on driveways and access roads required by the City 
on Nixa Planning and Zoning Department as recommended by the Fire 
Department applicable to the property in question, provided that fire lanes 
may not be established on property containing one or two family residential 
dwellings.  
 

2. Upon notice by the fire chief of designation of a fire lane, it shall be the duty 
of the owner, occupant, or his agent, of the premises upon which the fire lane 
has been designated, to post proper signs and to maintain such signs and curb 
markings in good condition 

 
B. Section 505.1, Address Numbers, of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be 

amended to read as follows; 
 



NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
 
Adopted Ordinance # Title     
09/20/11 004-2011 2006 IFC Page 3 of 5 

1. All such numbers shall be placed facing street, plainly visible from the street, 
shall be of a contrasting color to the background, shall be not less than four 
inches high, shall be in plain Arabic type, shall be made with a width 
equivalent to at least a half of an inch wide and shall not be more than 50 feet 
from the street, except as provided in subsection (2) of this section. 

 
2. If the number is more than 50 feet from the street, the numbers shall be a 

minimum of six inches in height, except in no event shall such number be 
more than 100 feet from the street. 

 
3. All businesses shall affix a street number to the rear of the business so as to be 

plainly visible from the rear access area.  The size of the number posted shall 
be in accordance with the requirements set out in subsections (1) and (2) of 
this section.    

 
C. Section 506.1, Key Boxes, of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be amended 

to read as follows; 
 
1. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because of 

secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or 
fire-fighting purposes, the code official is authorized to require a key box to 
be installed in an accessible location. The key box shall be of an approved 
type and shall contain keys to gain access as required by the code official. The 
KNOX Key Box shall be ordered from www.knoxbox.com. 
 

D. Section 506.1.1, Locks, of the 2006 International Fire Code shall be amended to 
read as follows; 
 
1. When a building within the Nixa Fire Protection District is protected by an 

automatic fire suppression or standpipe system.   
 
2. When a building is protected by an automatic alarm system and/or access to or 

within a building, or an area within that building, is unduly difficult because 
of secured openings, and where immediate access is necessary for life saving 
or firefighting purposes. 

 
3. When a property is protected by a locked fence or gate and where immediate 

access to the property is necessary for life saving or firefighting purposes. 
 
4. Any change of occupancy including renovations or remodel in a building 

meeting the requirements above.  

http://www.knoxbox.com/


NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
 
Adopted Ordinance # Title     
09/20/11 004-2011 2006 IFC Page 4 of 5 

5. The KNOX Rapid Entry System shall be located; 
 

a. Gated areas and secured areas around buildings and residential areas will 
be required to have a KNOX Key Switch or KNOX Pad Lock for 
emergency access. 
 

b. Buildings shall place the box at or near the left of the recognized public 
entrance on the exterior of the structure approved by the Fire Marshal. 
 

c. The lock box shall be located at a height of not less than four (4) feet and 
not more than six (6) feet above final grade. 

 
d. An alternate location shall be approved by the Fire Marshal if construction 

features do not allow for placement near the entrance. 
 

e. No steps, displays, signs or other fixtures, or structure protrusions shall be 
located under the box which would allow intruders to access the box 
without assistance. 

 
6. The KNOX Box shall contain the keys and items of the following;  

 
a. The main entrance door 
b. Alarm room 
c. Mechanical rooms 
d. Sprinkler control rooms 
e. Any other room specified during plan review 
f. Fire alarm control panel 
g. Special keys to pull-stations or other fire protection devices 
h. Elevator keys 
i. Alarm codes or alarm silencing procedure 

 
The keys shall be labeled to be easily identified in the field 

 
III. Chapter 9, Fire Protection Systems: 
 

A. Section 912.2, Fire Department Connections, of the 2006 International Fire Code 
is to be amended to read the following; 
 
1. With respect to hydrants, driveways, building and landscaping, fire 

department connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose 



NIXA FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT 
 
Adopted Ordinance # Title     
09/20/11 004-2011 2006 IFC Page 5 of 5 

connected to supply the system will not obstruct access to the buildings for 
other fire apparatus. 
 
a. Fire department connections shall be located a minimum of forty (40) feet 

or 1 and a half times the height of the building from the building 
whichever is greater on buildings with 3 or more stories or greater than 
30’ tall to minimize the potential for structural collapse onto fire 
department equipment and personnel.  Fire department connections shall 
be located a maximum of thirty (30) feet from an accessible fire hydrant.  
Said hydrant shall be located on the same side of the fire department 
access road as the fire department connection. All fire department 
connections shall be painted red and labeled with signage reading “Fire 
Department Connection” in an approved method by the fire code official.  
Fire department connections not able to meet requirements based on 
location and access shall be approved by the fire code official. 

 
INSPECTIONS AND ENFORCEMENT 
 
The City of Nixa, Chief Building Inspector is responsible for inspections and shall have 
the authority to make inspections and enforce the ICC International Fire Code as adopted 
by the Nixa Fire Protection District. 
 
Nothing in this ordinance or Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any 
suit or proceeding in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause 
or causes of action acquired existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed:  nor 
shall any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by 
this Ordinance. 
 
Adopted, by the Board of Directors of the Nixa Fire Protection District, this 20th day of 
September, 2011, and shall take full force and effect as of the 3rd day of October 2011. 
 
 
_________________________________     _________________________________ 
Board President    Attest: Board Secretary 


